Attachment 4

Custodial Supplies 2013-06

Description Packaging Price/unit Brand Bid
1|General Purpose Cleaner *Concentrate
Ready to Use Liter
Quart| $2.45 X12 (CASE) BOARDWALK
One-Gallon| $5.49 X4 (CASE) BOARDWALK
Five-Gallon
2|Neutral Cleaner *Concentrate
Ready to Use Liter
Quart
One-Gallon $8.00 x4 (CASE) FRANKLIN
Five-Gallon $33.25 FRANKLIN
3|Disinfectant Cleaner Concentrate *Concentrate
Ready to Use| Liter
Quart
One-Gallon $14.66 X4 (CASE) AMREP-MISTY
Five-Gallon
4lDeodorant Concentrate and Counteractant l_gallon bottles/4 bottle/case $71.61 DIVERSEY
5]Odor Neutralizer/Counteractant 1/2 ounce $53.00/180 PKS DIVERSEY EASY PAKS
6)Bowl Cleaner (non-acid) *Concentrate
Ready to Use Liter]
Quart $2.20 FRANKLIN
One-Gallon
}Eive—GaIlon
7|Bowl Cleaner (acid) quart container $2.45 AMREP-MISTY
8|Liquid/Vomitous Absorbent one pound
other (specify)| $2.99/12 OZ. CAN FRESH-SUPERSORB
9]Glass Cleaner Concentrate *Concentrate
Ready to Use Liter
Quart $2.10 BOARDWALK
One-Gallon $5.00 BOARDWALK
Five-Gallon
10]Bleach gallon $11.85 PUREBRIGHT
11fHeavy Duty Degreaser Cleaner gallon $8.25 BOARDWALK
12]|Powdered Cleanser Case (specify) $37.00 COMET
13|Odor Granules pound
14]Hospital Spray Disinfectant Case (specify) $55.00/12 (CASE) AMREP-MISTY
15A |Dust Mop Heads dozen
15B |Dust Mop Frames & Handles HANDLES EACH $10.00 UNISAN
18" length, 5" width dozen $43.00 UNISAN
3 1/2" width dozen
24"length, 5 width dozen $46.56 UNISAN
3 1/2" width dozen
30"length, 5'width dozen $69.25 UNISAN
3 1/2"width dozen
36'length, 5'width dozen $62.00 UNISAN
3 1/2"width dozen
48"length, 5"width dozen $70.50 UNISAN
3 1/2"width dozen
60"length, 5"width dozen| $92.40 UNISAN
3 1/2"width dozen
72"length, 5 width dozen $123.50 UNISAN
3 1/2" width dozen
16}Liquid Hand Soap 12 x 1 liter refill/case
gallon $4.99 BOARDWALK
17|Powdered Hand Soap 5 pound box $6.85 DIAL-BORAXO
18]Corn Brooms dozen $98.50 UNISAN
19|Floor Brushes dozen $138.00 RUBBERMAID
20jHandles dozen $38.75 BOARDWALK
21| Duster dozen $115.50 IMPACT
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Description Packaging Price/unit Brand Bid
22]Dust Pan with Pivoting Handle 6/case $49.75 IMPACT
23]Lobby Dustpan Broom dozen $78.12 RUBBERMAID
24|Dust Pan dozen $23.80 IMPACT
25| Water Bucket dozen $95.00 RUBBERMAID
26|Mop Bucket & Wringer Combination

26 quart each $67.00 RUBBERMAID

35 quart each $80.00 RUBBERMAID
27|Mop Heads each CLAMP-ON SCREW-IN

20 oz. Cotton dozen| $34.90/RUBBERMAID $69.85/UNISAN
Rayon dozen $50.25/UNISAN $74.50/UNISAN
24 oz Cotton dozen| $40.00/RUBBERMAID $78.25/UNISAN
~ Rayon dozen $50.00/UNISAN $85.50/UNISAN
32 oz. Cotton dozen| $51.75/RUBBERMAID $98.50/UNISAN
ﬁayon dozen| $79.95/RUBBERMAID $110.50/UNISAN
28]Mop Handles dozen $62.00/UNISAN $60.00/UNISAN
29)Commode Mops 200/case $125.00 IMPACT
30}Liquid Drain Solvent Maintainer quart $5.75 AMREP-MISTY
31}Garbage Cans
44 gallon each $42.00 RUBBERMAID
32 gallon each $27.25 RUBBERMAID
11 gallon each $13.85 RUBBERMAID
32]Garbage Can Lids
Flat - 44 gallon each $14.60 RUBBERMAID
Dome - 44 gallon each $68.00 RUBBERMAID
~ Flat- 32 gallon each $8.75 RUBBERMAID
Dome - 32 gallon each $65.00 RUBBERMAID
Flat - 11 gallon each| $24.00/FUNNEL TOP RUBBERMAID
Dome - 11 gallon each $25.00 RUBBERMAID
33| Trash Can Dolly 2/case $81.75 RUBBERMAID
34]Two Wheel Dolly each
35 Trash Can Liners
24x33 1,000/case $18.00 INTEPLAST GROUP
38x58 100/case| $25.00 INTEPLAST GROUP
36]White Roll 'I-'owels 30 rolls/case $20.50 BOARDWALK
37a |Coreless Toilet Tissue 36 rolls/case
37b |Roll Toilet Tissue 96 rolls/case $38.50 GEN
38} Toilet Paper Dispenser
for 37A each
for 37B each $7.80 SAN JAMAR
39[Single Fold Towels Gcase $23.95 BOARDWALK
mzs case $17.75 GEN
Z1a |Roll Paper Towels case $19.50 BOARDWALK
41b |Roll Paper Towels case $52.75 ENMOTION
41c  |Roll Paper Towels case
42|Roll Paper Towel Dispenser
for 41a each $35.00 GEORGIA PACIFIC
for 41b each $69.00 GEORGIA PACIFIC
for 41¢ each
43|Plastic Bottles
16 oz, each $0.55 IMPACT
24 oz each $0.55 UNISAN
320z each $0.65 UNISAN
16 oz 100/case $51.00 IMPACT
24 0z 100/case $53.00 UNISAN
320z 100/case $55.00 UNISAN
448 Trigger sprayers
16 oz each $0.55 UNISAN
24 oz each $0.55 UNISAN
32 oz each $0.55 UNISAN
16 oz 100/case $55.00 UNISAN
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24 oz 100/case $55.00 UNISAN
320z 100/case $55.00 UNISAN
45[Fumniture Polish each $2.99 BOARDWALK
12 cans/case $35.88 BOARDWALK
46| Floor Machine Carbon Screens 10/box
47|Floor Machine Pads
12! 5/box| $7.25 PREMIERE
13" 5/box $8.05 PREMIERE
14" 5/box $9.25 PREMIERE
15" 5/box| $10.00 PREMIERE
16" 5/box $10.80 PREMIERE
19" 5/box $15.00 PREMIERE
20" 5/box $15.85 PREMIERE
Boost Machines
4" x 28| 5/box
48I500d|ebug Pads 5/box $3.20 3M
49|Doodlebug Holder 12/box $74.75 PREMIERE
50| Urinal Screen/Deodorizer 18/case $8.60 KRYSTAL
51|Windshield De-lcer 12/box
52| Soil Extraction Carpet Cleaner
*Concentrate
Ready to Use Liter
Quart
One-Gallon $10.00 AMREP-MISTY
Five-Gallon
53)Defoamer 4 gal/case $65.00 AMREP-MISTY
54)Carpet Cleaning Bonnet 2/case
55]Carpet Cleaner (for use with bonnet) 4 galicase
56|Carpet Spot and Stain Cleaner quart $3.35 FRANKLIN
57)Air Freshener Cans 12 quart/case
58 Vandalism Mark Remover 12 cans/case $52.00 BOARDWALK
59|Chewing Gum Remover 12 cans/case
60 Sanitary Napkin Disposal Units each $31.00 BOBRICK
61]Wasp and Hornet Spray 12 cans/case $57.00 DIVERSEY-RAID
62)Ice Melt specify packaging
63| Wiping ﬁags 10 pound box
64|Pretreated Dust Cloth 48 $54.75 CHIX
65| Scrubbing Sponge 20/case $15.85 PREMIERE
66|Sponge (Heavy Duty) 48/case $45.00 CLOROX
Wtambs Wool Refills
12" each $7.65 UNISAN
14" each| $8.75 UNISAN
16" each| $9.65 UNISAN
24" each $14.50 UNISAN
68|Entrance Mats
3'%5" each
4'x6' each
4'x8' each
4'xstate length each
69| Disposable Gloves
Small 100/box $5.75 IMPACT
Medium 100/box $5.75 IMPACT
Large 100/box $5.75 IMPACT
X-Large 100/box $5.75 IMPACT
70[Natural Latex Unsupported Gloves
Small 100/box $14.50 BOARDWALK
Medium 100/box $14.50 BOARDWALK
Large 100/box $14.50 BOARDWALK
X-Large 100/box| $14.50 BOARDWALK
71}Vinyl Exam Gloves
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Small 100/box $3.20 IMPACT 8606
Medium 100/box $3.20 IMPACT 8606
Largef 100/box $3.20 IMPACT 8606
X-Large 100/box $3.20 IMPACT 8606
72|Nitrile Gloves
Small 10 box/case $64.90 IMPACT 8646
Medium 10 box/case $64.90 IMPACT 8646
Large 10 box/case $64.90 IMPACT 8646
X-Large 10 box/case $64.90 IMPACT 8646
XX-Large 10 box/case
73|Electric Hand Dryers 4/case
74}High Speed Buffer each $988.50 MERCURY
75|Propane Powered High Speed Burnisher each
76|Battery Powered Burnisher each
77|Floor Machine Scrubber each
_?§|Wet/Dry Vacuum each
79)Vacuum cleaner each $170.00 RUBBERMAID CMRL
80| Type B Disposable Vacuum Bags case $20.00/PK 10 RUBBERMAID
81|Vacuum Cleaner Brush each
82|Vacuum Belts each $16.20/PK 7 RUBBERMAID
83|Floor Finish 5 gallon
84|Floor Finish case
85|Floor Stripper *Concentrate
1-liter,
dispenser
Ready to Use Liter
Quart
One-Gallon
Five-Gallon
86[|Non-Acid Disinfectant Restroom Cleaner case $170.75 DIVERSEY
87|Spray & Foam Gun unit
88|Kaivac Rinse quart,
gallon
89a [Kaivac Kaiblooey Cleaner case
89b [Kaivac Kibosh Cleaner case
90fWater Soluble Deodorant case $53.50 FRESH PRODUCTS
91 Spray Buff case] $30.00 GL/$132.00 CASE DIVERSEY
Company KERR OFFICE GROUP, INC.
Address 117 North Main Street Elizabethtown, KY 42701
Phone Number (270) 765-6171
Email Address MRICE@KERROG.COM
MATT RICE

Signature
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Description Packaging Price/unit Brand Bid
1|General Purpose Cleaner *Concentrate 36.37 SM TNF #5 096911
Ready to Use Liter
Quart
One-Gallon
Five-Galion $39.31 Soo Blue Thunder 242010
Z|Neutral Cleaner *Concentrate, $46.60 SM TNF #3 098503
Ready to Use Liter
Quart
One-Gallon
Five-Gallon $23.10 KNDC Neutral CI 055015
3|Disinfectant Cleaner Concentrate *Concentrate $53.13 SM TNF #25 098532
Ready to Use Liter
Quart
One-Gallon $28.55 ooo DO Gold 245210
Five-Gallon $30.75 o505 DC Gold 243213
4|Deodorant Concentrate and Counteractant gallon bottles/4 bottle/case $65.03 Diversey Good sense 027300
5]Odor Neutralizer/Counteractant 1/2 ounce $47.99 Diversey DIBs 160207
6|Bowl Cleaner {non-acid) *Concentrate $133.08 M TNF #15 098510
Ready to Use Liter
Quart $2.08 S50 Pleasant Clean 00000 /A
One-Gallon
Five-Gallon
7|Bowl Cleaner (acid) quart container $2.99 oS5 PS1T 050608A
8Liquid/Vomitous Absorbent one pound
other (specify) $28.44 Voban 15 Ibs. 235578
9|Glass Cleaner Concentrate *Concentrate $48.58 3M TNEF #1 088501
Ready to Use Liter
Quart $1.97 S5o Blue U50512
One-Gallon $5.71 ooo Blue 050913
Five-Gallon
10}Bleach gallon $2.37 KIK PURE BRIGHT BLEACH
11|Heavy Duty Degreaser Cleaner gallon $8.83 o000 oecond Shitt 242048
12]Powdered Cleanser Case (specify) $18.45 o905 24 /0o 271 0L 000511
13)Odor Granules pound $1.90 Voban 15 [bs. 235578
14]Hospital Spray Disinfectant Case (specify) $48.54 Soo Disintectant 1/9012
15A [Dust Mop Heads dozen
15B [Dust Mop Frames & Handles
18" length, 5" width dozen 65.04 /93.60 S55 T17285A/1/7285/117450
3 1/2" width dozen 73.08/93.60 Soo T17218A/MT/7218/11/430
24"length, 5"width dozen 78.84/96.48 Soo 117287TAM17287/M17450
3 172" width dozen £3.88/ 96.48 SoS 117224A 1172241117450
SOWength, 5"width dozen
3 1/2"width dozen
36"length, 5"width dozen 110.04 / 102.00 SooT1/7289A/11/7289/M1 17400
3 1/2"width dozen 126,72/ 102.00 Soo 117250A/117230/114750
48"length, 5'width dozen 144.60/117.00 So5 117280/M17290A/11/7450
3 1/2"width dozen 163.80/ 117.00 ooo 117248A117248/11/7450
60"length, 5"width dozen 224.40/132.00 o005 T17294/117294A/117450
3 1/2"width dozen 249.72 1 132.00 oo 117200A/117260/11/450
72"length, 5"width dozen 264.12 /144.00 Soo 11/7295/117295A/11/7450
31/2" width dozen 269.52 [ 144.00 SSS 1172 2AMT72721M717450
16}Liquid Hand Soap 12 x 1 liter refill/case $69.36 Diversey Sott Care Antl U35060
gallon $10.28 Soo Control 130110
17Powdered Hand Soap 5 pound box
18 Corn Brooms dozen $118.80 SSS #22 081623
19Floor Brushes dozen $131.28 ooo U81811
20|Handles dozen $40.25 oo 117005
21| Duster dozen $71.42 Impact 3100 1172211
22|Dust Pan with Pivoting Handle 6/case $86.92 Impact 2600 085580
23|Lobby Dustpan Broom dozen $66.00 S50 0816355
24{Dust Pan dozen $46.23 ooo Us0110
25]Water Bucket dozen $97.80 RM 2553501

26|Mop Bucket & Wringer Combination
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26 quart each $69.56 555 1500004
35 quart gach $69.56 S5S 100000A
27 Mop Heads each
20 oz. Cotton dozen $29.04 Soo 115020A
Rayon dozen $41.52 o595 116020A
24 oz Cotton| dozen $34.08 ooo T10024A
Rayon dozen $49.20 o505 110024A
32 0z. Coton dozen $43.20 ooo T15032A
Rayon dozen $61.20 Soo 116082A
28[Mop Handles dozen $102.00 Soo 116415
29lCommode Mops 200/case $152.50 ooo 116471A
30]Liquid Drain Solvent Maintainer quart $4.78 ooo 090713
31]Garbage Cans
44 gallon| each $28.98 BRONCO 283020
32 gallon each $18.60 BRONCO 283010
11 gallon each $12.00 BRONCO 283000
32| Garbage Can Lids
Flat - 44 gallon each $11.75 BRONCO 263022
Dome - 44 gallon each $80.75 BRONCO 283029
Flat - 32 gallon each $6.60 BRONCO 263012
Dome - 32 gallon each $58.30 BRONCO 265014
Flat - 11 gallon each $3.80 BRONCO 263002
Dome - 11 gallon each
33[Trash Can Dolly 2/case $73.30 BRONCO 283030
34| Two Wheel Dolly each
35]Trash Can Liners
24x33] 1,000/case $19.70 ooo 200501
38x58| 100/case $35.34 Soo 200434
36[White Roll Towels 30 rolls/case $20.50 VD 4100 140025
37a [Coreless Toilet Tissue 36 rolls/case $53.30 GP 19376 140601
370 |Roll Toilet Tissue 96 rolls/case $45.60 VD 5501 146110
38 Toilet Paper Dispenser
for 37A each NC with paper GP 5o0/84 1400056
for 37B each $7.50 RT 220/1/03
39]Single Fold Towels case $22.75 VD 540-K - 140055 - 4000/CS
40[Multi Fold Towels case $17.00 VD 548-K - 146005 - 4000/CS
41a [Roll Paper Towels case $24.15 VD 842-N - 146015 - 12/4257C
41b  |Roll Paper Towels case $63.85 GP 89460 - 142025 - EnMotion
41c  |Roll Paper Towels case $58.25 Sos /6301 - 146200 - Sterling
42[Roll Paper Towel Dispenser
for 41a each $55.50 VD 52010 - 146017
for 41b each NC with paper GP 59400 - 1420600
for 41c each NC with paper VD 52001 - 146200
43]Plastic Bottles
16 0z each $0.65 Soo 170217
240z each
320z each $0.85 oS00 170218
16 oz 100/case $48.00 oo 170217
24 0z T00/case "$75.00
320z 100/case oo 170218
441 Trigger sprayers
16 oz each $0.60 Soo1/UZ219A
24 oz each
320z each $0.68 Soo 170219
16 oz 100/case $55.00 Soo 17/0219A
24 0z 100/case
32 oz 100/case $60.00 Soo 170219
45]Furniture Polish each $3.06 ooo 179010
12 cansfcase $38.20 oo 179010
46]Floor Machine Carbon Screens 10/box $42.26 o55 2/1391
47 JFloor Machine Pads
12" 5/box $8.45 SO0
13 5/box $9.12 S3S5S)
14" 5/box! $10.64 Soo
15" 5/box $12.09 SISt
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16" 5/box $12.55 SO0
19" 5/box $16.84 ISistsy
20" 5/box $17.52 555
Boost Machines
14" X 28" 5/boX $32.22 S5 271257
48 Doodlebug Pads 5/box| $8.42 3M
49| Doodlebug Holder 12/box $52.32 Malish 080262
50§Urinal Screen/Deodorizer 18/case $11.02 oS00 Uo181T 12/CS
51jWindshield De-lcer 12/box
52]Soil Extraction Carpet Cleaner
*Concentrate $44.98 SM TNF #9 088512
Ready to Use| Liter
Quart
One-Gallon| $14.48 o505 New Concept 050912
Five-Gallon
53| Defoamer 4 gal/case S47.75 Soo Detoamer 0508911
54]Carpet Cleaning Bonnet 2/case $33.20 SSS Carpet Bonnet 1/1313A
55Carpet Cleaner (for use with bonnet) 4 gal/case $56.22 o555 Bonnet CI 050913
56| Carpet Spot and Stain Cleaner quart $3.70 o905 AP Spotter 050850
57| Air Freshener Cans 12 quart/case $33.51 Diversey Good Sense U36/07
58] Vandalism Mark Remover 12 cans/case $61.20 Soo Censor 1780717
59]Chewing Gum Remover 12 cans/case $33.36 555 Gum Remover 050980
60]Sanitary Napkin Disposal Units each $43.88 RM 6140 - 255801
61fWasp and Hornet Spray 12 cans/case $58.03 Soos W & HT/70300
62fIce Melt specify packaging $8.85 555 o0 Lb. White Fever 16700
63Wiping Rags 10 pound box
64|Pretreated Dust Cloth 48 $83.00 GP 219215 - 2007 G5
85[Scrubbing Sponge 20/case $13.39 oo 237000
66)Sponge (Heavy Duty) 50/case $147.50 SM 170811
67Lambs Wool Refills
12" cach $5.37 SSS 117611A
14" each $6.17 oo T1/0612A
16:’ each! $8.33 Soo 11/613A
24" each $10.30 So0 11/0614A
[~ 68|Entrance Mals
3X5' each $34.68 SSS 100070
4'%6' each $55.78 oo 100085
4'x8' each $72.58 SISESS
4'xstate length each $181.44 005 4 x 20
69]Disposable Gloves
Small 100/box| $5.24 Ambitex 233065
Medium 100/box $5.24 Ambitex 233066
Large 100/box $5.24 Ambitex 233007
X-Large 100/box $5.24 Ambitex 233068
70fNatural Latex Unsupported Gloves
Small 100/box| $6.88 Ambitex 2330708
Medium 100/box $6.88 Ambitex 2350715
Large 100/box $6.88 Ambitex 253072b
X-Large 100/box $6.88 Ambitex 2330/3B
_TTrVinyl Exam Gloves
Small 100/box| $3.15 Ambitex 235095
Medium 100/box $3.15 Ambitex 2530200
Large 100/box $3.15 Ambitex 23305/
X-Large 100/box $3.15 Ambitex 235056
72|Nitrile Gloves
Small 10 box/case $50.00 Ambitex 233075
Medium 10 box/case $50.00 Ambitex 233070
Large 10 box/case $50.00 Ambitex 233077
X-Large 10 box/case $50.00 Ambitex 233076
XX-Large 10 box/case
73|Electric Hand Dryers 4/case $315.00 S50 171111 Each
74]High Speed Buffer each $658.41 Soo Cheetah 199310
75]Propane Powered High Speed Burnisher each Clarke 185000
76| Battery Powered Burnisher each $5,610.50 TomCat 200200
77|Floor Machine Scrubber each $486.98 ooo Cougar 199500
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[~ 78] WetDry Vacuum each $447.30 So5 Black Cal 199540
79)Vacuum cleaner each $171.93 S50 HBITO0 - 190107
80fType B Disposable Vacuum Bags case $5.65 S50 6b0b36 - 3/PKg
81|Vacuum Cleaner Brush each $28.45 D00 03410
82 Vacuum Belts each $1.35 ooo 140
83|Floor Finish 5 gallon $57.38 Soo Miraquest 240210
84]Floor Finish case $609.98 3M Vinyl Floor Protector 09672
85 Floor Stripper *Concentrate
1-liter $47.74 3M TNF #6 09800/
dispenser| NC with product 3M TNF Dispenser U88527
Ready to Use Liter,
Quart
One-Gallon
Five-Gallon $40.69 ooo laurus 241210
86| Non-Acid Disinfectant Restroom Cleaner case $42.83 Pleascent Clean 4gl/cs 245415
87|Spray & Foam Gun unit] $51.10 Foam Gun 027205
88[Kaivac Rinse quart $89.10 KaiDri 052010
gallon
89a [Kaivac Kaiblooey Cleaner case §73.94 KaiBlooey 052000
89b [Kaivac Kibosh Cleaner case $78.30 KiBosh 052025
90JWater Soluble Deodorant case $55.10 Diversey Good Sense 027350
91|Spray Buff case $43.84 Star Gate 12qt/cs 244000

Company: Kenway Distributors, Inc.

Address: 6320 Strawberry Lane Lou. KY 40214
Phone Number: (502)367-2201 (800)292-9478
Email Address: jmackey@kenway.net

Signature
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Description

Packaging

Price/unit

Brand Bid

-

General Purpose Cleaner

*Concentrate

Ready to Use

Liter

Quart

One-Gallon

Five-Gallon

2|Neutral Cleaner

*Concentrate

Ready to Use

Liter

Quart

One-Gallon

Five-Gallon

Disinfectant Cleaner Concentrate

*Concentrate

Ready to Use

Liter

Quart

One-Gallon

Five-Gallon

S

Deodorant Concentrate and Counteractant

gallon

bottles/4 bottle/case

5]Odor Neutralizer/Counteractant 1/2 ounce

6|Bow! Cleaner (non-acid) *Concentrate

T&Eady to Use Liter|

Quart

One-Gallon

Five-Gallon

7|Bowl Cleaner (acid) quart container|

8|Liquid/Vomitous Absorbent one pound

other (specify)

9|Glass Cleaner Concentrate *Concentrate

ﬁeady to Use Liter|

Quart

One-Gallon

Five-Gallon

10}Bleach gallon

11|Heavy Duty Degreaser Cleaner gallon

12]Powdered Cleanser Case (specify)

13]0dor Granules pound

14]Hospital Spray Disinfectant Case (specify)

15A |Dust Mop Heads dozen

(158 |Dust Mop Frames & Handles

18" length, 5" width dozen

3 1/2" width| dozen

24"length, 5"width dozen

3 1/2" width dozen

30:Iength, S width dozen

3 1/2"width dozen

367Iength, 5"width dozen

3 1/2"width dozen

48"length, 5"width dozen

3 1/2"width dozen

60"length, 5"width dozen

3 1/2"width dozen

72'length, 5'width dozen

3 1/2° width dozen

16|Liquid Hand Soap 12 x 1 liter refilicase

gallon

17F3wdered Hand Soap 5 pound box
18|Corn Brooms dozen

19|Floor Brushes dozen

20fHandles dozen

21|Duster dozen
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Description Packaging Price/unit Brand Bid
a2 —
22|Dust Pan with Pivoting Handle 6/case
23|Lobby Dustpan Broom dozen
24|Dust Pan dozen
25|Water Bucket dozen
26]Mop Bucket & Wringer Combination
26 quart each $61.59| RUBBERMAID
35 quart each $108.20|RUBBERMAID
27|Mop Heads each
20 oz. Cotton| dozen
Rayon dozen
24 oz Cotton dozen
Rayon dozen
32 oz. Coton dozen
Rayon dozen
28{Mop Handles dozen
29]Commode Mops 200/case
30 Liquid Drain Solvent Maintainer quart
31|Garbage Cans
44 gallon each $42.38|RUBBERMAID
32 gallon each $27.23|RUBBERMAID
11 gallon each $13.79|RUBBERMAID
32| Garbage Can Lids
Flat - 44 gallon each $14.80|RUBBERMAID
Dome - 44 gallon each
Flat - 32 gallon each $8.93|RUBBERMAID
Dome - 32 gallon each
Flat- 11 gallon each $5.09|RUBBERMAID
Dome - 11 gallon each
33| Trash Can Dolly 2/case $86.10|RUBBERMAID
34| Two Wheel Dolly each
35]Trash Can Liners
24x33 1,000/case $15.40JCENTRAL POLY
38%58 100/case $18.40) CENTRAL POLY
36]|White Roll Towels 30 rolls/case $24.60 ATLAS
37a [Coreless Toilet Tissue 36 rolls/case
37b |Roll Toilet Tissue 96 rolls/case $47.60JATLAS
38|Toilet Paper Dispenser
for 37A each
for 37B each $30.00JCENTRAL POLY
39|Single Fold Towels case $17.90)PUTNEY
40|Multi Fold Towels case $17.80|PUTNEY
41a |Roll Paper Towels case $17.70JPUTNEY
41b jRoll Papeﬁowels case $43.66|VONDREHLE
41¢c  |Roll Paper Towels case $43.66]VONDREHLE
42 ma_per Towel Dispenser
for 41a each $30.00JCENTRAL POLY
for 41b each $61.00JCENTRAL POLY
for 41c ‘gach $61.00]CENTRAL POLY
43|Plastic Bottles
16 oz each
240z each
320z each
16 oz| 100/case
24 oz 100/case
32 oz 100/case
444 Trigger sprayers
16 0z each
24 oz, each
32 0z each
16 oz 100/case
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24 oz 100/case
32 0z 100/case
45|Furniture Polish each
12 cans/case
46|Floor Machine Carbon Screens 10/box
47|Floor Machine Pads
o 5/box|
13" 5/box|
14" 5/box|
187 5/box|
16" 5/box|
19" 5/box
20" 5/box
Boost Machines

14" x 28" 5/box
48|Doodlebug Pads 5/box|
491Doodlebug Holder 12/box
50}Urinal Screen/Deodorizer 18/case
51|Windshield De-icer 12/box

52[Soil Extraction Carpet Cleaner
*Concentrate
Ready to Use Liter]
Quart
One-Gallon
Five-Gallon
53|Defoamer 4 galfcase
54)Carpet Cleaning Bonnet 2/case|
55|Carpet Cleaner (for use with bonnet) 4 gal/case
56 Carpet Spot and Stain Cleaner quart

57
58

Air Freshener Cans

12 quart/case

Vandalism Mark Remover

12 cans/case

59]Chewing Gum Remover 12 cans/case
G0JSanitary Napkin Disposal Units each $37.74|RUBBERMAID
61fWasp and Hornet Spray 12 cans/case
62fIce Melt specify packaging
63|Wiping Rags 10 pound box
64|Pretreated Dust Cloth 48
65|Scrubbing Sponge 20/case
66{Sponge (Heavy Duty) 50/case
67JLambs Wool Refills
12" each
14" each
16" each
24" each
68| Entrance Mats
3'x6' each
4'x6' each
4'x8' each
4'xstate length each
69| Disposable Gloves
Small 100/box
Medium 100/box
Large 100/box
X-Large 100/box
[~ 70|Natural Latex Unsupported Gloves
Small| 100/box
Medium 100/box
Large 100/box
X-Large 100/box

71

Vinyl Exam Gloves
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Attachment 4

Custodial Supplies 2013-06

Description Packaging Pricelunit Brand Bid
Small 100/box
Medium 100/box
Large 100/box
X-Large 100/box
72| Nitrile Gloves
Small 10 box/case $56.39JAMMEX
Medium 10 box/case $56 39| AMMEX
Large 10 box/case $56.39] AMMEX
X-Large 10 box/case $56.39 AMMEX
XX-Large 10 box/case
73|Electric Hand Dryers 4/case
[~ 74 High Speed Buffer each
75| Propane Powered High Speed Burnisher each
76 Eamowered Burnisher each
77||Floor Machine Scrubber each
78{Wet/Dry Vacuum each
79]VVacuum cleaner each
80| Type B Disposable Vacuum ﬁa_gs case
81fVacuum Cleaner Brush each
82| Vacuum Belts each
83| Floor Finish 5 gallon
84{Floor Finish case
85|Floor Stripper *Concentrate
1-liter
dispenser
‘ﬁeady to Use Liter]
Quart
One-Gallon
Five-Gallon
86|Non-Acid Disinfectant Restroom Cleaner case
87Spray & Foam Gun unit
88|Kaivac Rinse quart
gallon
89a |[Kaivac Kaiblooey Cleaner case
89b [Kaivac Kibosh Cleaner case
90| Water Soluble Deodorant case
91| Spray Buff case
Company CENTRAL POLY CORP
2400 BEDLE PLACE
Address LINDEN, NJ 07036

Phone Number

908-862-7570

Email Address

BIDS@CENTRAL

POLY.COM

Signature
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Attachment 4

Custodial Supplies 2013-06

Description

Packaging

Pricelunit

Brand Bid

-t

General Purpose Cleaner

*Concentrate,

$16.22 per 2 Liter

I?Eeady to Use

Liter

Quart

0.12

One-Gallon

$0.48

Five-Gallon

N

Neutral Cleaner

*Concentrate

$8.00 per 2 liter

Spartan Damp Mop COG

Ready to Use

Liter

Quart

$0.06

One-Gallon

$0.24

Five-Gallon|

3|Disinfectant Cleaner Concentrate

*Concentrate

13.08 per 2 liter

Spartan Hdg C2 COG

Ready to Use Liter
Quart $0.10
One-Gallon $0.40
Five-Gallon
4]|Deodorant Concentrate and Counteractant gallon bottles/4 bottle/case $42.00)Spartan Consume 1:2 dil.
5]Odor Neutralizer/Counteractant 172 ounce $6.00 / gallon Floor Prep
6|Bowl Cleaner (non-acid) *Concentrate}$27.78 per 2 liter Spartan NABC COG
Ready to Use Liter
Quart $0.21
One-Gallon $0.82
Five-Gallon
~7|Bowl Cleaner (acid) quart container| $2.50}Spartan MLD
8]Liquid/Vomitous Absorbent one pound $2.30}Voban
other (specify)
9|Glass Cleaner Concentrate *Concentrate]$29.05 per 2 liter Spartan Window Cleaner COG
Ready to Use Liter|
Quart $0.21
One-Gallon $0.86
Five-Gallon
10|Bleach gallon $2.00{PureBight
11fHeavy Duty Degreaser Cleaner gallon $10.50)Spartan Tribase
12J|Powdered Cleanser Case (specify){$23.28 per case Fitzpatrick
13}Odor Granules poundl $2.30]Voban
14]Hospital Spray Disinfectant Case (specify)| $34.65|Claire #238
15A |Dust Mop Heads dozen
158 |[Dust Mop Frames & Handles Goldenstar Frame and Handle Replacement Heads
18" length, 5" width dozen $98.76 $54.72
3 1/2" width dozen $98.76 $52.56
24ﬁength, 5"width dozen $101.28 $67.68]
3 1/2" width dozen $101.28 $64.44
30"length, 5"width dozen $106.32 $76.56
3 1/2"width dozen $106.32 $95.76
36"length, 5"width dozen} $106.32 $95.76
3 1/2"width dozenl $106.32 $91.68
48"length, 5"width dozen| $114.00 $120.24
3 1/2"width dozen $114.00 $115.20
BOFIength, 5 width dozen $126.36 $176.64]
3 1/2"width dozen $126.36 $172.00}
72"length, 5'width dozen $133.56 $236.64
3 1/2" width dozen $133.56 $230.00
16]Liquid Hand Soap 12 x 1 liter refill/case
gallon $5.00|CPG Pink
17|Powdered Hand Soap 5 pound box $7.00|Boraxo
18]Corn Brooms dozen $91.44)Abco #306
19|Floor Brushes dozen $108.48]|Abco #11008
20fHandles dozen $30.96fAbco #01104
21|Duster dozen $128.64fImpact #3106
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Attachment 4

Custodial Supplies 2013-06

Description Packaging Price/unit Brand Bid
22[Dust Pan with Pivoting Handle 6/case $52.02fimpact #2600
23]Lobby Dustpan Broom dozen $28.20§jAbco #321
24|Dust Pan dozen $24.00|Impact £710
25|Water Bucket dozen| $57.00)Contico #8110
26[Mop Bucket & Wringer Combination
26 quart each $79.00fContico #335.37
35 quart each $79.00|Contico #335.37
27|Mop Heads each|ABCO Clamp On LayFlat Screw On
20 oz. Cotton dozen $37.20 $72.60
i-?ayon dozen $55.15 $75.00
24 oz Cotton dozen $42.90 $78.96
Rayon dozen $65.60 $86.40
32 oz. Coton| dozen $53.80 $99.60
Rayon dozen $83.00 $111.60
28]Mop Handles dozen $64.08 $69.72
29]Commode Mops 200/case $140.00flmpact #204
30]Liguid Drain Solvent Maintainer quart| $2.75|Bloc-Aid
31]Garbage Cans
44 gallon each $32.05]Contico #4444
32 gallon each $19.80}Contico #3200
11 gallon each $10.05}Contico #1001
32|Garbage Can Lids
Flat - 44 gallon each $11.50]Contico #4445
Dome - 44 gallon each $57.45]Contico #4456
Flat - 32 gallon each| $6.75]Contico #3201
Dome - 32 gallon each $55.80)Contico #3232
Flat - 11 gallon each $3.85|Contico #1002
Dome - 11 gallon each|NO BID N/A
33|Trash Can Dolly 2/case $48.50)Contico #3255
34|Two Wheel Dolly each $113.95|Contico #43
35|Trash Can Liners
24x33 1,000/case $16.50]EC2433N
PACKED 150/CS TEX58 150/cs $22.60| VALH3B860N22
36|White Roll Towels 30 rolls/case $22.25)|Baywest #410
37a |Coreless Toilet Tissue 36 rolls/case $45.50|GP 19375
37b |Roll Toilet Tissue 96 rolls/case $42.00)Atlas #125
38 ToiIetE’aper Dispenser TWO PLY $32.75|Atlas #275
for 37A ach| $12.00|GP 53771
for 37B each $8.00}lmpact #2500
39|Single Fold Towels case| $17.60|GP 23504
40{Multi Fold Towels case $17.60jGP 23304
41a |Roll Paper Towels case $21 .OOIAﬁKSSO
41b jRoll Paper Towels case $55.20]GP 89460
41c |Roll Paper Towels case]NO BID N/A
42]Roll Paper Towel Dispenser
for 41a each $28.00|GP 54338
for 41b each $60.00JGP 59462
for 41c each|NO BID N/A
43|Plastic Bottles
16 oz, each $0.56{Impact #5016
24 0z each $0.56)Impact #5024
320z each $0.56fImpact #5032
16 oz 100/case $56.00fImpact #5016
24 oz 100/case $56.00)Impact #5024
320z 100/case $56.00}Impact #5032
44 Trigger sprayers
16 oz each $0.56fImpact #6800
24 oz each $0.56fImpact #6800
32 oz| each $0.56{Impact #6800
16 oz 100/case $0.56]Impact #6800
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Attachment 4 Custodial Supplies 2013-06

Description Packaging Pricelunit Brand Bid
24 0z 100/case $0.56]Impact #6800
320z 100/case $0.56|Impact #6900
45|Furniture Polish each $2.37|Clarie #232
12 cans/case $28.44|Claire #232
46||Floor Machine Carbon Screens 10/box $50.00jAmerico
47|Flioor Machine Pads
5/box $7.25fAmerico
5/box| $8.00JAmerico
5/box $9.20jAmerico
5/box| $10.00JAmerico
5/box $10.80JAmerico
5/box $14.05|Americo
5/box $15.20}Americo
Boost Machines
10/box 147 x2 10/box $64.00|Americo
48]Doodlebug Pads 5/box| $3.50fAmerico
49)Doodlebug Holder 12/box $79.68Impact #2000
50fUrinal Screen/Deodorizer 1dz per case 12/cs $9.36)Impact #1451
51|Windshield De-lcer 12/box $41.04Claire #758
52)Soil Extraction Carpet Cleaner
1:64 Dilution Rate *Concentrate $7.50fSpartan
Ready to Use Liter
Quart
One-Gallon
Five-Gallon
53)|Defoamer 4 gal/case $74.00]Spartan
54fCarpet Cleaning Bonnet 2/case $47.00{RM P269
55]Carpet Cleaner (for use with bonnet) 4 gal/case $60.00|Spartan BTL
56)Carpet Spot and Stain Cleaner quart $2.10{Spartan SSE
57]Air Freshener Cans 12 quart/case $28.20|Spartan Airlift
58|Vandalism Mark Remover 12 cans/case $42.00|Claire #237
59]Chewing Gum Remover 12 cans/case $23.64|Claire #241
60)Sanitary Napkin Disposal Units each $44.00RM 6140
61|Wasp and Hornet Spray 12 cans/case $60.00{Claire #005
62|1ce Melt 50# per bag specify packaging $11.00|Frantz
63|Wiping Rags 10 pound box $15.00JAnchor
64|Pretreated Dust Cloth 2 Packs / o0 per pack 100 $55.000Masslin
65{Scrubbing Sponge 20/case $17.00JAmerico
[~ G6|oponge (Heavy Duty) 46 Per case 48]case $44.64|Americo
67|Lambs Wool Refills
12" each $4.00)Carlisle
14" each $5.00|Carlisle
16" each $6.00)Carlisle
24" each $8.00|Carlisle
68|Entrance Mats
%5 each $30.00jAmerico
4'%x6" each $48.00JAmerico
4'x8' each $64.00fAmerico
4'x60° 60" each $480.00§Americo
69]Disposable Gloves
Small 100/box $4.50|Safety Zone
Medium 100/box $4.50]Safety Zone
Large 100/box $4.50)Safety Zone
X-Large 100/box $4.50)Safety Zone
70]Natural Latex Unsupported Gloves
Small 100/box $6.60[Safety Zone
Medium 700/box $6.60|Safety Zone
Large 100/box $6.60 Safetﬁone
X-Large 100/box $6.60] Safety Zone
71]Vinyl Exam Gloves
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Custodial Supplies 2013-06

Description Packaging Price/unit Brand Bid
Small 100/box $2.90|Safety Zone
Medium 100/box $2.90|Safety Zone
Large 100/box $2.90Safety Zone
X-Large 100/box $2.90|Safety Zone
[~ 72|Nitrile Gloves
Small 10 box/case $4.75|Safety Zone
Medium 10 box/case $4.75)Safety Zone
Large 10 box/case $4.75)Safety Zone
X-Large 10 box/case| $4.75)Safety Zone
XX-Large 10 box/case| NO BIDN/A
73|Electric Hand Dryers 4/case $175.00jPalmer #3907
74]High Speed Buffer each $975.00Advance
75Propane Powered High Speed Burnisher each $3,170.00|Advance
76|Battery Powered Burnisher each $5,100.00fAdvance
77||Floor Machine Scrubber each $680.00|Advance
78 |Wet/Dry Vacuum each $515.00fAdvance
79[Vacuum cleaner gach $280.00fRoyal
80| Type B Disposable Vacuum Bags 240/case $156.00]Royal
81| Vacuum Cleaner Brush each $25.95|Rovyal
82| Vacuum Belts each $1.36]Royal
83|Floor Finish 5 gallon $56.47|Sunny Side
84|Floor Finish case|NO BID N/A

85lFloor Stripper 1:10 Dilution Rate

5 gallon "Concentrate

$46.00§Square One

1-liter
dispenser,
Ready to Use Liter
Quart
One-Gallon
Five-Gallon
86|Non-Acid Disinfectant Restroom Cleaner 12/case $22.20{Spartan NABC
87|Spray & Foam Gun unit| $56.00)Impact
88[Kaivac Rinse quart]NO BID
gallonjNO BID
89a [Kaivac Kaiblooey Cleaner case|NO BID
89b JKaivac Kibosh Cleaner case{NO BID
90| Water Soluble Deodorant case $42.00fSpartan Consume
91|Spray Buff case $31.00Spartan

Company: Consolidated Paper Group, Inc.

Address: 325 Emmett Ave

Bowling Green, KY 42101

Phone Number: 270-842-6502

Email Address: Tbertram@conpaper.com

Signature
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Custodial Supplies 2013-06

Description

Packaging

Pricel/unit

Brand Bid

-

General Purpose Cleaner

*Concentrate

BID-13005Q SIMPLE GR

Ready to Use

Liter|

Quart

One-Gallonf|17.62/EA GALLON

—
Five-Gallon

N

Neutral Cleaner

*Concentrate

NO BID

Ready to Use

Liter

Quart

One-Gallon

Five-Gallon

[#%)

Disinfectant Cleaner Concentrate

*Concentrate

BID-76185 LYSOL

Ready to Use

Liter

Quart

One-Gallon

13.87/EA GALLON

Five-Gallon

ey

|Deodorant Concentrate and Counteractant

gallon bottles/4 bottle/case

NO BID

[4)]

Odor Neutralizer/Counteractant

1/2 ounce

NQO BID

(2]

Bowl Cleaner (non-acid)

*Concentrate

BID-22704Q SEVENTH (

Ready to Use

Liter

Quartl4.72/EA QUART

One-Gallon

Five-Gallon

~

Bowl Cleaner (acid)

quart container|3.37/EA

BID-74278 LYSOL

o]

Liquid/Vomitous Absorbent

one pound

NO BID

other (specify)

©

Glass Cleaner Concentrate

*Concentrate

NO BID

Ready to Use

Liter|

Quart

One-Gallon

Five-Gallon

108Bleach

gallon

NO BID

11

Heavy Duty Degreaser Cleaner

gallon

$17.62|B1D-13005Q SIMPLE GR

12|Powdered Cleanser

Case (specify)

NO BID

13]Odor Granules

pound

NO BID

14'Hospita| Spray Disinfectant

Case (specify)

NO BID

15A

Dust Mop Heads

dozen

NO BID

15B

Dust Mop Frames & Handles

NO BID

18" length, 5" width

dozen

3 1/2" width

dozen

24"length, 5"width

dozen

3 1/2" width

dozen

30"length, 5"width

dozen

3 1/2"width

dozen

36"length, 5"width

dozen

3 1/2"width

dozen

48"length, 5'width

dozen

3 1/2"width

dozen

60"length, 5"width

dozen

3 1/2"width

dozen

72"length, 5'width

dozen

3 1/2" width

dozen

16|Liquid Hand Soap

12 x 1 liter refill/case

NO BID

gallon

17|Powdered Hand Soap

5 pound box

NO BID

18] Corn Brooms

dozen

NO BID

19|Floor Brushes

dozen|26.62/EA 319.44/FOR 12

BID-7966010RS MAGNC

20fHandles

dozen||2.47/EA 29.64/FOR 12

BID-BRU122 PROLINE |

21

Duster

dozenld. 12/EA 49.44/FOR 12

BID-L26 DUSTER CATS
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Attachment 4 Custodial Supplies 2013-06
Description Packaging Pricelunit Brand Bid
22|Dust Pan with E‘Evoting Handle 6/case NO BID
23|Lobby Dustpan Broom dozen|39.74IDZ |BID-UNS951BPUCE UNI
24|Dust Pan Jozen|3.74/EA 44.88/FOR 12 |BID-2005CH RUBBERMY
25fWater Bucket dozen NO BID |
26|Mop Bucket & Wringer Combination “EACH BID-P7677YELUCB RUB
26 quart each
35 quart each||149.99/EA
27|Mop Heads each BID-UNS2024C UNISAN
20 oz. Cotton dozen
Rayon dozen
24 oz Cotton dozen|39.74/CS 12/CS
ﬁayon dozen
32 oz. Coton dozen
Rayon dozen
28|Mop Handles dozen|[8.62/EA 103.44 FOR DZ |BID-UNS1490 UNISAN
29|Commode Mops 200/case NO BID
30} Liquid Drain Solvent Maintainer quart INO BID
31|Garbage Cans BID-2632GY RUBBERM/
44 gallon each
32 gallon each|31.49/EA
11 gallon each
32|Garbage Can Lids BID-2631GY RUBBERM/
Flat - 44 gallon each
Dome - 44 gallon each
Flat - 32 gallon each|8.00/EA
Dome - 32 gallon| each
Flat - 11 gallon each
Dome - 11 gallon each

33| Trash Can Dolly 2/case 52.40/EA 104.98/FOR 2 |BID-2640BK RUBBERM/
34| Two Wheel Dolly each T18.49/EA BID-148268BAR SAFCO
35'-Trash Can Liners
24x33 1,000/case
38x58 100/case24.74/CS BID-814869 BRIGHTON
36| White Roll Towels 30 rolls/case|26.99/CS BID-7HH290 QUILL
37a [Coreless Toilet Tissue 36 rolls/case NO BID
37b [Roll Toilet Tissue 96 rolls/case INO BID
38| Toilet Paper Dispenser NO BID
for 37A each
for 37B each
39]Single Fold Towels case|28.49/CS BID-20904Q ENVISION
40{Multi Fold '?owels case}24.74/CS IBID-23304 ENVISION
41a_|Roll Paper Towels case|24.74/CS BID-41230 HEAVENLY S
21b |Roll Paper Towels case NO BID
41¢c  |Roll Paper Towels casel52.49/CS BID-89460 ENMOTION
ml Dispenser BID-59460Q ENMOTION
for 41a each 74.99/EA
for 41b each
for 41c| each
43|Plastic Bottles NO BID
16 oz each
24 0z each
32 oz each
16 oz 100/case
24 oz| 100/case
320z 100/case
44 ‘-I'rigger sprayers BID-UNS9229 IMPACT
16 0z each
24 oz| each
320z each|.74/EA
16 oz 100/case
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Custodial Supplies 2013-06

Description Packaging Price/unit Brand Bid
24 oz, 100/case
32 0z 100/case
45|Furniture Polish each NO BID
12 cans/case
46 Floor Machine Carbon Screens 10/box NO BID
47|Floor Machine Pads NO BID
12" 5/box
13" 5/box|
14" 5/box|
15" 5/box
16" 5/box
19" 5/box
20" 5/box
Boost Machines NO BID
14" x 28" 5/box
48|Doodlebug Pads 5/box NO BID
49]Doodlebug Holder 12/box NO BID
50}Urinal Screen/Deodorizer 18/case NO BID
51]Windshield De-Icer 12/box NO BID
52]Soil Extraction Carpet Cleaner NO BID
*Concentrate
Ready to Use Liter
Quart
One-Gallon
Five-Gallon
53| Defoamer 4 gal/case NO BID
54| Carpet Cleaning Bonnet 2/case NO BID
55| Carpet Cleaner (for use with bonnet) 4 gal/case NO BID
56| Carpet Spot and Stain Cleaner quart NO BID
57|Air Freshener Cans 12 quart/case I'No BID
58|Vandalism Mark Remover 12 cans/case NO BID
59fChewing Gum Remover 12 cans/case NO BID
60} Sanitary Napkin Disposal Units each NO BID
61|Wasp and Hornet Spray 72 cansicase|5.47/EA 65.64/FOR 12 BID-94898 RAID
62fIce Melt specify packaging NO BID
63|Wiping Rags 10 pound box NO BID
64|Pretreated Dust Cloth 48 NO BID
65| Scrubbing Sponge 20/case NO BID
66]Sponge (Heavy Duty) 50/case NO BID
67 Lambs Wool Refills NO BID
12" each
14" each
16" each
24" each
68JEntrance Mats
36 each $44.24|BID-CB0035GY
%6 each $70.34|BID-CB0046BR
4'x8' each $86.62|BID-DS0048WA
4'xstate length each
69|Disposable Gloves
Small 100/box $8.79§BID-CUR8104H
Medium 100/box $8.79|BID-CUR8105H
Large 100/box $8.79|BID-CUR8106H
X-Large 100/box $8.70|BID-CURS107H
70{Natural Latex Unsupported Gloves NO BID
Small 100/box
Medium 100/box
Large| 100/box
X-Large 100/box
71}Vinyl Exam Gloves
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Custodial Supplies 2013-06

Description Packaging Price/unit Brand Bid
Small 100/box| $6.39]BID-55010Q
Medium 100/box $6.39{BID-55011
Large 100/box $6.39]BID-55012
X-Large 100/box
72| Nitrile Gloves
Small 10 box/case NO BID
Medium 10 box/case}4.49/BX BID-NGPF300 DESIGNE
Large 10 box/case NO BID
X-Large 10 box/case 4.49/BX
XX-Large 10 box/case NO BID
73|Electric Hand Dryers 4/case NO BID
74}High Speed Buffer each NO BID
75|Propane Powered High Speed Burnisher each NO BID
76|Battery Powered Burnisher each NO BID
77|Floor Machine Scrubber each NO BID
78 Wetff)ry Vacuum each NO BID
_7§r\7acuum cleaner each NO BID
80| Type B Disposable Vacuum Bags case NO BID
81[Vacuum Cleaner Brush each NO BID
82]Vacuum Belts each NO BID
83|Floor Finish 5 gallon NO BID
84|Floor Finish case NO BID
85| Floor Stripper *Concentrate NO BID
1-liter
dispenser|
Ready to Use Liter
Quart|
One-Gallon
Five-Gallon
86[Non-Acid Disinfectant Restroom Cleaner case NO BID
87]Spray & Foam Gun unit NO BID
88|Kaivac Rinse quart] NO BID
gallon
89a |[Kaivac Kaiblooey Cleaner case NO BID
89b [Kaivac Kibosh Cleaner case NO BID
90fWater Soluble Deodorant case NO BID
91|Spray Buff case INO BID
Company QUILL CORPORATION
Address 100 SCHELTER RD LINCOLNSHIRE, IL 60069
Phone Number 800-634-4809
Email Address BID@QUILL.COM
Signature

Page 4



